
Duration

5 Days

Target Group
School & high school teachers

About the Course

Math through e-debate

The program aims to improve primary and
lower secondary teachers’ knowledge,
skills, and abilities through professional
qualification. It focuses on inclusive
lessons, motivation, and STEAM (Science,
Technology, Engineering, Arts, and
Mathematics) to enhance students’
learning and motivation in mathematics.

Primary and lower secondary mathematics
teachers will be able to:

Gain first-hand knowledge of the needs of
the students in order to motivate them in
mathematics.
To become familiar with good practices for
motivating learners and creating an
inclusive classroom.
Learn a methodology based on e-debate
to include and motivate all learners in the
class.
Get familiar with learning disabilities, such
as dyscalculia, dysgraphia, dyslexia and
ADHD among others, how to detect and
address them
Know more about the needs of gifted
students and how to motivate them.
Have access to lesson plans based on
STEAM.
Learn how to apply the new methodology
in context.
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